
Mission Statement: The Christian School of Grace Baptist Church seeks to partner with parents by providing 

for their children a Christ-centered education that prepares them to serve God for time and eternity with their 

head, heart, and hands. 

Values Statement: 

The Bible The Family The Classroom 

The Bible is the only sufficient, 
certain, and infallible rule of all 
saving knowledge, faith, and 
obedience. 

At Grace, we teach that all of life 
must be related to God, and thus 
that all education must be in 
accordance with the Word of God. 

• Romans 15:4

• 2 Timothy 3:15–17

God has given parents the primary 
responsibility to educate their 
children in the nurture and 
admonition of the Lord. 

At Grace, through effective 
communication and a common 
goal, we partner with parents in 
the training of their children. The 
family, the church, and the school 
should be working together to 
provide a consistent Christian 
education. 

• Deuteronomy 6:5-7

• Ephesians 6:4

Teachers engage the minds of 
students and direct the goals of 
the classroom.  

At Grace, teachers’ attitudes and 
relationships with students will 
reflect practical, experiential, and 
living Christianity. Teachers will 
create an environment where 
there is an enthusiasm and a love 
for learning. Teachers seek 
opportunities to address heart 
issues and promote a biblical way 
of thinking. 

• 2 Corinthians 10:4-5

• Proverbs 9:10
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Academics Christian Graces Civic Responsibility 

At Grace, we provide a rigorous, 
organized, and thought-out 
curriculum that thoroughly 
prepares students for secondary 
education and equips them to be 
life-long learners. All of our study 
is founded on the God’s Word and 
biblical principles are applied to 
every part of life. Students will 
recognize God’s works and be 
aware of His presence in a 
practical and meaningful way in all 
phases of education and life. 
Incorporated into all academic 
courses will be a particular focus 
on developing creativity, critical 
thinking skills, and effective written 
and verbal communication skills. 

• 2 Timothy 3:14-15

At Grace, it is our desire that 
spiritual growth go hand in hand 
with academic growth. The good 
news of the gospel, God’s saving 
grace, and His redemptive 
purposes are clearly 
communicated. 

It is our desire to develop in each 
student a servant attitude and 
Christian graces. 

• 2 Peter 1:1-7

• Galatians 5:22-23

At Grace, we prepare students for 
adult citizenship and a proper 
respect and submission to those 
in positions of authority. 

Understanding that government is 
ordained by God, individuals 
should be productive and 
contributing members of their 
nation and local community. 

• 1 Peter 2:13-14.

• Matthew 5:16.


